
StrikeForce Initiative for Rural Growth and Opportunity 

TENNESSEE 
Currently, 85 percent of our country’s persistent poverty counties are in rural 
America. More than one third of rural Americans, and one in four rural children 
live in poverty.  Kids growing up in families earning twice the poverty threshold 
are nearly three times as likely as other children to have poor health, are more 
likely to finish two fewer years of school, and are more likely to earn half as much 
money in their adult lives.  

Growing the economy by investing in rural communities and increasing 
opportunities for families is key to our Nation’s future.  In 2010, Secretary Vilsack 
established USDA’s StrikeForce Initiative for Rural Growth and Opportunity to 
address the specific challenges associated with rural poverty.  Since then, 
StrikeForce teams have collaborated with more than 1,500 community partners 
and public entities to bring targeted assistance to rural areas experiencing chronic 
poverty.   

These efforts have invested more than $23.5 billion to create jobs, build homes, 
feed kids, assist farmers and conserve natural resources across more than twenty 
states.  In 2016, StrikeForce expanded to include Florida, Missouri, Montana, and 
Ohio.  Now, USDA StrikeForce teams will operate in 970 counties in 25 states 
and Puerto Rico.  Each StrikeForce project is a commitment to America’s 
economic future. 

Tennessee Fast Facts - 2015 

StrikeForce State Since: 

State’s Overall Poverty Rate: 

State’s Child Poverty Rate: 

Number of StrikeForce Counties: 

Total Outreach Events:   

Number of Community Partners: 

Total USDA Projects: 

Total USDA Investment: 

Contacts 

Contact us to be a partner, or to learn more 

about StrikeForce opportunities: 

John.Rissler@tn.usda.gov 

(615) 277-2576 

Congressional Inquiries: 

(202) 720-7095 

Media Inquiries: 

(202) 720-4623 

Some of Our StrikeForce  

Community Partners 

Agribusiness Committee of Greene County  

AgriCenter International  

Centro Hispano de East Tennessee 

Greeneville Farmers Market  

Landmark Training & Development Corp.  

National Exchange Club  

Roots Memphis  

Rural Resources of Greene County  

Southern Foodways Alliance  

Tennessee Disabled American Veterans 

Urban Farms Memphis/Binghampton  

Development Corp.  

Monroe County Boys and Girls Club  

2015 

17.8% 

25.7% 

53 

252 

76 

4,383 

$499.7 million 

StrikeForce At Work 

Tennessee’s USDA Farm Service Agency and Natural Resource and Conservation 
Service presented technical workshops at the two first sessions of the Tennessee 
New Farmer Academy at Tennessee State University this fiscal year. The USDA 
agencies’ workshops focused on program and loan information that beginning 
farmers need to know for their agricultural operations to get off to a good start 
and succeed. The New Farmer Academy is for new owners and potential owners 
of small farms who want training on ways to best utilize their land for crops and 
livestock. The program offers information about opportunities for new farmers 
to expand into different areas of production, gain access to and knowledge about 
federal funds and programs, and to develop new marketing strategies to make 
them successful in business. The New Farmer Academy coordinator and lead 
trainer asked USDA to advise and assist the Academy in the future.  

The New Farmer Academy is funded in part by part of a $188,055 grant to 
educate and provide technical assistance to agriculture operators and businesses 
distributed through the Outreach and Assistance for Socially Disadvantaged 
Farmers and Ranchers Grant Program.  The initial participants included Women, 
African and African-Americans, Veterans and Youth. 

The strong interconnected and collaborative nature of USDA in Tennessee is 
clearly evident in the relationship USDA agencies enjoy with TSU’s Cooperative 
Extension Program and NIFA.  FSA, NRCS, and RD regularly provide technical 
assistance workshops, presentations, and exhibits at TSU outreach conferences 
and events throughout the state and throughout the year.  USDA agencies 
participate in the University’s career development and recruiting events. TSU 
receives 1890s grants from USDA and special projects grants through Rural 
Development.   

www.usda.gov/strikeforce 
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4,383 Projects in 2015 = $499.7 Million Invested 
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